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A comprehensive, concise text on strategic management as it applied to a variety
of health care organizations: physicians offices, hospitals, long-term care, health
departments and others. The central theme of the text is that business-oriented
strategic management can improve the success of health care organizations.

New to the fourth edition:

each chapter has been fully updated and revised●

situational analysis and implementation are explicitly tied together through the●

value chain framework
it includes 22 case studies, of which 10 are brand-new.●

The text also retains the important features that have made previous editions of
the book such a success. Each chapter contains:

a generous number of examples and exhibits●

summaries and conclusions●

key terms and concepts●

questions for class discussion●

additional readings●

appendices that assist readers by presenting ways to analyze health care cases●

and make oral presentations.

The text is supported by PowerPoint Slides and a Teacher's Manual. Visit
www.blackwellpublishing.com/ginter for details.
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Editorial Review

Review
"I have been using this book as a required text since the very first edition. It provides a framework which
integrates some of the most important concepts in modern management with cases from the health services
field. I highly recommend the book and compliment the authors for their important contributions to our
field." Dr Barry R Greene, University of Iowa

"For years, this book has been the definitive text on strategic management in healthcare. This fourth edition
will assure faculty offer current thinking in strategy formulation and implementation." Dr Janet E Porter,
University of North Carolina at Chapel Hill

"The new 4th edition is substantively the authors' best effort to date. Each chapter has been updated and
improved, innovative materials enhance the analysis and implementation content, and the cases offer a
broadly representative spectrum of strategically challenging siturations. Most significantly, the new edition
refocuses the primary orientation of the text to that of strategic thinking (not just the technology of doing)
and of strategic management as leadership. both essential oreientations that are missing from any works on
strategic management. This transformation strengthens the integration and cohesion of the text's content in a
way that Ithink students of strategy will find helpful and compelling." Dr Barbara Arrington, St Louis
University

From the Inside Flap

The 6th edition of this classic strategic management text provides up-to-date and concise coverage of all the
essential strategic momentum. In this edition, the authors have comprehensively addressed issue assessment
in the health care environment, service area competitor analysis, internal organizational analysis,
development of directional strategies, strategy formulation, and strategy implementation.

Through the many new examples and perspectives integrated throughout the text along with numerous
“strategic thinking maps” and analysis techniques, readers of this text will be able to develop comprehensive,
well-documented, and innovative strategies for health care organizations. The focused format of this edition,
combined with web support, make this an essential and accessible read.

Highlights of the sixth edition:

• This edition is rich in new examples from real-world health care organizations

• In response to the waning interest among senior executives in the pursuit of short-term value, the authors
have concentrated on the fundamentals of strategy analysis and the underlying sources of long-term success

• Chapters are brought to life by the Introductory Incidents, Learning Objectives, Perspectives, Lessons for
Health Care Managers, Managers Bookshelf, and questions for class discussion

• The teaching materials and web supplements have been greatly enhanced in this edition, with power-point
slides and other handy tools to give professors a unique resource



From the Back Cover
This classic text for health care students as well as health care managers and leaders is now available in its
fourth edition, providing further guidance and focus on strategic thinking, strategy formulation,
implementation, and control. The fourth edition reflects the importance of leadership in contemporary health
care organizations. In addition, the authors have further developed their "map and compass" theme to foster
strategic thinking.

New to the fourth edition:

each chapter has been fully updated and revised●

situational analysis and implementation are explicitly tied together through the value chain framework●

it includes 22 case studies, of which 10 are brand-new.●

The text also retains the important features that have made previous editions of the book such a success.
Each chapter contains:

a generous number of examples and exhibits●

summaries and conclusions●

key terms and concepts●

questions for class discussion●

additional readings●

appendices that assist readers by presenting ways to analyze health care cases and make oral presentations.●

The text is supported by PowerPoint Slides and a Teacher's Manual. Visit
www.blackwellpublishing.com/ginter for details.

Users Review

From reader reviews:

Sam Holmes:

Have you spare time to get a day? What do you do when you have much more or little spare time? That's
why, you can choose the suitable activity with regard to spend your time. Any person spent all their spare
time to take a move, shopping, or went to the Mall. How about open or maybe read a book titled Strategic
Management of Health Care Organizations? Maybe it is to become best activity for you. You understand
beside you can spend your time with your favorite's book, you can cleverer than before. Do you agree with
their opinion or you have some other opinion?

Maryellen Tilley:

This Strategic Management of Health Care Organizations book is just not ordinary book, you have it then the



world is in your hands. The benefit you have by reading this book is actually information inside this book
incredible fresh, you will get facts which is getting deeper an individual read a lot of information you will
get. This kind of Strategic Management of Health Care Organizations without we understand teach the one
who reading through it become critical in thinking and analyzing. Don't possibly be worry Strategic
Management of Health Care Organizations can bring whenever you are and not make your tote space or
bookshelves' come to be full because you can have it within your lovely laptop even cellphone. This
Strategic Management of Health Care Organizations having fine arrangement in word and also layout, so
you will not feel uninterested in reading.

Christopher Hendrick:

This Strategic Management of Health Care Organizations is great guide for you because the content that is
certainly full of information for you who else always deal with world and possess to make decision every
minute. That book reveal it info accurately using great arrange word or we can state no rambling sentences
included. So if you are read it hurriedly you can have whole facts in it. Doesn't mean it only offers you
straight forward sentences but tough core information with lovely delivering sentences. Having Strategic
Management of Health Care Organizations in your hand like having the world in your arm, data in it is not
ridiculous one particular. We can say that no publication that offer you world in ten or fifteen moment right
but this guide already do that. So , this is good reading book. Hi Mr. and Mrs. occupied do you still doubt in
which?

Elizabeth Nicholson:

Beside this specific Strategic Management of Health Care Organizations in your phone, it may give you a
way to get closer to the new knowledge or info. The information and the knowledge you can got here is fresh
from your oven so don't be worry if you feel like an outdated people live in narrow community. It is good
thing to have Strategic Management of Health Care Organizations because this book offers for you readable
information. Do you sometimes have book but you rarely get what it's all about. Oh come on, that will not
end up to happen if you have this within your hand. The Enjoyable set up here cannot be questionable,
including treasuring beautiful island. Use you still want to miss it? Find this book along with read it from
now!
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