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Bridging the world of traditional fairy tales and magical fantasy, Roald Dahl
again proves himself the master of children's literature, creating a world to spark
the imagination. Filled with terrifying nightmare creatures and captivating "little
people," all captured in the fascinating and mysterious paintings of an award-
winning illustrator. Full color throughout.
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Editorial Review

Amazon.com Review
Someday someone will write a book that begins with a mother forbidding her child to enter the deep dark
woods and ends with that child achieving incredible success without ever setting a toe in the forbidden
forest. But not this book. Here, Billy's mom issues a few scary warnings about the woods to her son--
"Beware! Beware! The Forest of Sin! None come out, but many go in!"--turns her back for a second, and the
next thing you know the devil shows up and whispers something to Bobby about wild strawberries. Blammo!
Guess where Billy goes--straight to the forbidden forest, of course. At this point, if you are reading the story
aloud to your child, you may think there's a parable on the way. But just when you might expect to run into
monsters named Lust, Avarice, and Three-Toed Sloth (okay, maybe not Lust), a real monster comes
careening along and you realize that this story is just a fairy tale after all--and quite a lovely one at that.

The Minpins taps into the powerful, wonderful child's fantasy of discovering a hidden civilization of tiny folk
that accepts and honors him or her. The very best part of this fairy tale is the denouement, where Billy
receives the gift of nightly escape on the wings of a swan. One of Roald Dahl's only picture books--with
fabulously crosshatched pen-and-ink illustrations by Patrick Benson--The Minpins is superb for reading
aloud to the three- to eight-year-old set. And it culminates in a sentence or two of advice that your children
just might remember for the rest of their lives. (Ages 3 to 8)

From School Library Journal
Kindergarten-Grade 2-- Little Billy, bored with being good, ignores his mother's admonition to stay out of
The Forest of Sin where "none come out, but many go in." He succumbs to the Devil's invitation to explore
the forest for himself. All is well until the boy hears the alarming sounds of a fire-breathing monster headed
right for him. Luckily he discovers a tree of convenient size where, on climbing to its upper branches, he
finds a whole village of miniature people. The Minpins are also afraid of being gobbled up by the Red-Hot
Smoke-Belching Gruncher. The lad devises a plan to do away with the terrifying beast and is promised
nightly flights on the back of a swan by the grateful Minpins. No longer confined to his dull home, Little
Billy now discovers a world of wonders. The only adult mentioned is the boy's insensitive, doltish mother,
while the protagonist himself is admirable and enterprising, true to the author's form. Nonetheless, one
senses something of a kinder, gentler Dahl, who nudges his readers to become observers, for "the greatest
secrets are always hidden in unlikely places." However, the religious overtones seem curiously out of place.
Little Billy's name, too, may prove a bit precious for some readers. Benson's pen-and-ink crosshatched
drawings with full-color washes are pleasing but not memorable, with the exception of the dramatic
depictions of Billy and the swan. Although older readers will find the talepretty tame, the story-hour crowd
may find it a pleasant diversion. --Phyllis G. Si dorsky, National Cathedral School, Washington, DC
Copyright 1991 Reed Business Information, Inc.

From Kirkus Reviews
Disobeying his mother, Little Billy goes into the ``Forest of Sin,'' where he is very nearly devoured by a fire-
breathing monster. Just in time, he escapes up a tree, where he discovers a community of tiny people, the
Minpins. The Minpins' homes, into which Billy can peer with one eye, remind him of the Queen's Doll
House at Windsor Castle; they use their friends the birds for transport. When the Minpins explain that they,
too, are being terrorized by the Red-Hot Smoke-Belching Gruncher, Little Billy devises a heroic plan: riding
on a swan, he'll lure the monster into the lake (it can't see where it's going because of its own smoke). So he
does, becoming a hero, and thereafter secretly visits his new friends. Typical Dahl: a childlike adventure with
fantastical antagonists who have rib-tickling names, and a trite, airy moral (``Those who don't believe in



magic will never find it''). Benson brings it all to life in his skillfully detailed art-- crosshatched pen-and-ink
plus cheery color. There are several dramatic double spreads involving the monster, plus beguiling minutiae
of the Minpins' treetop life. The long text is suitable for reading aloud to younger children and will also
entertain the late author's older fans. (Fiction/Picture book. 4-10) -- Copyright ©1991, Kirkus Associates, LP.
All rights reserved.

Users Review

From reader reviews:

Donna Jost:

The book The Minpins can give more knowledge and information about everything you want. Why must we
leave the good thing like a book The Minpins? A few of you have a different opinion about guide. But one
aim that will book can give many data for us. It is absolutely suitable. Right now, try to closer with your
book. Knowledge or info that you take for that, you may give for each other; it is possible to share all of
these. Book The Minpins has simple shape but the truth is know: it has great and massive function for you.
You can appearance the enormous world by open and read a e-book. So it is very wonderful.

Maria Hernandez:

Book is to be different for each grade. Book for children until eventually adult are different content. As we
know that book is very important for people. The book The Minpins has been making you to know about
other information and of course you can take more information. It is extremely advantages for you. The
publication The Minpins is not only giving you far more new information but also to be your friend when
you really feel bored. You can spend your spend time to read your reserve. Try to make relationship while
using book The Minpins. You never feel lose out for everything in case you read some books.

Chung England:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your day time to upgrading your mind
skill or thinking skill possibly analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book when
compared with can satisfy your short period of time to read it because this time you only find e-book that
need more time to be examine. The Minpins can be your answer since it can be read by you actually who
have those short free time problems.

Alfred Gates:

Beside this particular The Minpins in your phone, it can give you a way to get nearer to the new knowledge
or facts. The information and the knowledge you may got here is fresh in the oven so don't always be worry
if you feel like an outdated people live in narrow town. It is good thing to have The Minpins because this
book offers for you readable information. Do you sometimes have book but you rarely get what it's
interesting features of. Oh come on, that will not happen if you have this with your hand. The Enjoyable
blend here cannot be questionable, just like treasuring beautiful island. So do you still want to miss the item?
Find this book in addition to read it from right now!
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