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Editorial Review

Review
"Professor Trigg's book is clear, accurate and absorbing, well worth recommending to anyone seriously
interested in finding out what sort of thing we might be thought to be." Stephen Clark, University of
Liverpool

‘Trigg’s new edition offers the best introduction available to prominent approaches to human nature. It is
lucid, accessible and comprehensive. The book will be highly engaging and instructive for undergraduate
students from various disciplines.’ – Paul Moser; Loyola University Chicago

‘The great attractions of Roger Trigg’s book are its interdisciplinary character and its broad historical sweep,
giving students a clear sense of both continuity and change in thought about fundamental issues concerning
human nature. I don’t know of any other book which rivals it in these respects.’ – E. J. Lowe, University of
Durham

From the Back Cover

Ideas of Human Nature presents twelve of the most influential western thinkers on the topic of human
nature. This updated second edition includes new chapters on Locke and Kant and a new conclusion on
postmodernism. The thinkers are all examined in their historical context and their relevance to contemporary
controversies is discussed.

The issues covered include perennial philosophical problems such as the connection between mind and body;
life after death; the role of reason; free will and determinism; the relationship between the individual and
society; and the problem of relativism.

This is a key text for anyone interested in the theories that have affected the course of human history and
continue to interest and challenge us today.

About the Author
Roger Trigg is Professor of Philosophy at the University of Warwick. His publications include Rationality
and Religion (Blackwell, 1998), Rationality and Science (Blackwell, 1993) and Understanding Social
Science (Blackwell, 1985). He was the first President (1993-6) of the British Society for the Philosophy of
Religion, and in 1996-7 was Stanton Lecturer in the Philosophy of Religion at the University of Cambridge.
He is currently President of the Mind Association.

Users Review

From reader reviews:

Evelyn Rodrigue:

What do you concentrate on book? It is just for students as they are still students or this for all people in the
world, exactly what the best subject for that? Simply you can be answered for that issue above. Every person



has several personality and hobby per other. Don't to be forced someone or something that they don't desire
do that. You must know how great and also important the book Ideas of Human Nature: An Historical
Introduction. All type of book would you see on many sources. You can look for the internet solutions or
other social media.

Sharonda Adair:

The ability that you get from Ideas of Human Nature: An Historical Introduction is a more deep you
searching the information that hide inside words the more you get thinking about reading it. It doesn't mean
that this book is hard to comprehend but Ideas of Human Nature: An Historical Introduction giving you
excitement feeling of reading. The article author conveys their point in a number of way that can be
understood by simply anyone who read it because the author of this e-book is well-known enough. This
particular book also makes your vocabulary increase well. It is therefore easy to understand then can go
along, both in printed or e-book style are available. We suggest you for having this kind of Ideas of Human
Nature: An Historical Introduction instantly.

Clarice Stephens:

This book untitled Ideas of Human Nature: An Historical Introduction to be one of several books that best
seller in this year, that is because when you read this reserve you can get a lot of benefit upon it. You will
easily to buy this particular book in the book shop or you can order it through online. The publisher in this
book sells the e-book too. It makes you quickly to read this book, because you can read this book in your
Touch screen phone. So there is no reason to you personally to past this e-book from your list.

Sylvia Alexander:

Would you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you are in the book store? Make an
effort to pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't determine book by its cover may
doesn't work here is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not because fantastic as in the
outside look likes. Maybe you answer might be Ideas of Human Nature: An Historical Introduction why
because the excellent cover that make you consider about the content will not disappoint a person. The inside
or content will be fantastic as the outside as well as cover. Your reading 6th sense will directly show you to
pick up this book.
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