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Editorial Review

From the Back Cover
GET A DETAILED ROAD MAP FOR WORLD-CLASS NEW PRODUCT DEVELOPMENT AND
DELIVERY -- NOW UPDATED WITH THE LATEST LOGISTICS TOOLS!

Logistics managers, engineers, and contractors can turn to the Second Edition of Logistics: Principles and
Applications for the latest tools needed for world-class new product development and delivery in both the
military and commercial sectors. This updated guide offers a detailed road map for logistics excellence,
covering design and production, product reliability, maintainability, quality assurance, supply chain
techniques, and more.

This expert resource explores the three broad areas of logistics systems engineering, acquisition and
production, and logistics systems management and operations. A classic overview of the body of knowledge
for the Certified Professional Logistician (CPL) exam, the Second Edition features:

Detailed information on quality assurance for operations management●

Incorporates SI (metric) units along with corresponding U.S. Customary System units●

New to this edition: new material on performance-based systems engineering and its impact on life cycle●

logistics

Capitalize on Updated Coverage of Every Major Logistics Topic:
Logistics Systems Engineering: Logistics Statistics * Reliability * Maintainability * Availability * Quality
Assurance * Human Factors Engineering * Safety Engineering * Acquisition and Production: Contracting
* Critical Path Analysis * Work Breakdown Structure (WBS) * Learning Curve * Financial Analysis *
Depreciation of Assets * Life-Cycle Cost Analysis * Performance-Based Systems Engineering * Logistics
Systems Management and Operations: Logistics Facilities * Packaging, Handling, Storage, and
Transportation * Inventory Management * Personnel Management * Logistics Technical Documentation *
Support and Test Equipment (S&TE) * Embedded Computer Resources * Equipment Maintenance * Design
Interface of Logistics Elements * Supportability Analysis Applied to Logistics * Configuration Management
(CM)

About the Author
John Langford is a Consulting Engineer, Logistics Technology, and has provided logistics, systems
engineering, and configuration management support for major DOD weapon system programs. In addition to
his U.S. and international technical training and educational achievements, he is recognized as a Certified
Professional Logistician (CPL), Certified Configuration Manager (CCM), recipient of the SOLE Eccles
Medal , SOLE Armitage Medal recipient, and published author for numerous and books on logistics and
supportability engineering.

Users Review

From reader reviews:

Dennis Stclair:

The book Logistics: Principles and Applications, Second Edition (McGraw-Hill Logistics Series) make one



feel enjoy for your spare time. You can utilize to make your capable a lot more increase. Book can to be your
best friend when you getting anxiety or having big problem using your subject. If you can make reading a
book Logistics: Principles and Applications, Second Edition (McGraw-Hill Logistics Series) to get your
habit, you can get more advantages, like add your capable, increase your knowledge about many or all
subjects. It is possible to know everything if you like open and read a e-book Logistics: Principles and
Applications, Second Edition (McGraw-Hill Logistics Series). Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that,
science guide or encyclopedia or other folks. So , how do you think about this reserve?

Teresa Dillard:

What do you think about book? It is just for students because they are still students or this for all people in
the world, what the best subject for that? Simply you can be answered for that problem above. Every person
has different personality and hobby per other. Don't to be forced someone or something that they don't would
like do that. You must know how great in addition to important the book Logistics: Principles and
Applications, Second Edition (McGraw-Hill Logistics Series). All type of book is it possible to see on many
methods. You can look for the internet sources or other social media.

Paula Salas:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our understanding for everything. By a e-book we can know
everything you want. A book is a set of written, printed, illustrated or maybe blank sheet. Every year had
been exactly added. This publication Logistics: Principles and Applications, Second Edition (McGraw-Hill
Logistics Series) was filled concerning science. Spend your extra time to add your knowledge about your
research competence. Some people has several feel when they reading any book. If you know how big
advantage of a book, you can experience enjoy to read a guide. In the modern era like currently, many ways
to get book that you just wanted.

Terry Snider:

That reserve can make you to feel relax. This kind of book Logistics: Principles and Applications, Second
Edition (McGraw-Hill Logistics Series) was colourful and of course has pictures on there. As we know that
book Logistics: Principles and Applications, Second Edition (McGraw-Hill Logistics Series) has many kinds
or category. Start from kids until youngsters. For example Naruto or Private eye Conan you can read and
think that you are the character on there. So , not at all of book are generally make you bored, any it can
make you feel happy, fun and rest. Try to choose the best book for yourself and try to like reading that.
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