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Editorial Review

About the Author
ABOUT THE AUTHOR

Stephen E. Lucas is Professor of Communication Arts and Evjue-Bascom Professor in the Humanities at the
University of Wisconsin-Madison, where he has taught since 1972. He received his bachelor's degree from
the University of California, Santa Barbara, and his master's and doctorate degrees from Penn State
University.

Professor Lucas has been recognized for his work as both a scholar and a teacher. His first book, Portents of
Rebellion: Rhetoric and Revolution in Philadelphia, 1765-1776, received the Golden Anniversary Award of
the National Communication Association in 1977 and was nominated for a Pulitzer Prize. His major articles
include "The Schism in Rhetorical Scholarship" (1981), "The Renaissance of American Public Address: Text
and Context in Rhetorical Criticism" (1988), "The Stylistic Artistry of the Declaration of Independence”
(1990), and “The Rhetorical Ancestry of the Declaration of Independence” (1998), for which he received the
Golden Anniversary Monograph Award of the National Communication Association. His most recent book
is Words of a Century: The Top 100 American Speeches, 1900-1999 (2009).

Professor Lucas has received a number of teaching awards, including the Chancellor's Award for Excellence
in Teaching at the University of Wisconsin and the National Communication Association’s Donald Ecroyd
Award for Outstanding Teaching in Higher Education. His lecture course on "The Rhetoric of Campaigns
and Revolutions" is among the most popular on campus and has twice been selected for statewide broadcast
in its entirety by Wisconsin Public Radio. Professor Lucas is featured in the Educational Video Group’s
program on the history of American public address, and he has appeared on the History Channel’s
documentary on the Declaration of Independence.

Professor Lucas has directed the introductory public speaking course at the University of Wisconsin-
Madison since 1973. Over the years he has been responsible for numerous teaching innovations and has
supervised the training of hundreds of graduate assistants. In addition to participating in public speaking
workshops and colloquia at schools throughout the United States, he has served as a judge for the major
national English-language public speaking competitions in China, has lectured at numerous Chinese
universities, and has conducted workshops for Chinese instructors on teaching public speaking.

Stephen Lucas and his wife, Patty, live in Madison, Wisconsin, and have two sons, Jeff and Ryan. His
interests include travel, sports, art, and photography.

Users Review

From reader reviews:

Jonathan Gomes:

What do you regarding book? It is not important along? Or just adding material when you require something
to explain what the one you have problem? How about your free time? Or are you busy individual? If you
don't have spare time to accomplish others business, it is give you a sense of feeling bored faster. And you
have extra time? What did you do? Every individual has many questions above. They need to answer that



question due to the fact just their can do this. It said that about guide. Book is familiar on every person. Yes,
it is proper. Because start from on pre-school until university need this specific The Art of Public Speaking
(Communication) to read.

Steven Strong:

Hey guys, do you would like to finds a new book to study? May be the book with the concept The Art of
Public Speaking (Communication) suitable to you? The particular book was written by well known writer in
this era. Typically the book untitled The Art of Public Speaking (Communication)is one of several books that
will everyone read now. That book was inspired a number of people in the world. When you read this book
you will enter the new age that you ever know ahead of. The author explained their plan in the simple way,
consequently all of people can easily to understand the core of this book. This book will give you a wide
range of information about this world now. In order to see the represented of the world in this book.

Dave Arreola:

Is it a person who having spare time after that spend it whole day by means of watching television programs
or just laying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This The Art of Public Speaking
(Communication) can be the solution, oh how comes? It's a book you know. You are therefore out of date,
spending your time by reading in this completely new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these
books have than the others?

Santiago Bronson:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got scholars? We believe that that query
was given by teacher to their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every person has different hobby. So you know
that little person like reading or as reading through become their hobby. You have to know that reading is
very important and also book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to add you knowledge, except your
personal teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update regarding something by book. Numerous
books that can you take to be your object. One of them is niagra The Art of Public Speaking
(Communication).
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