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Editorial Review

Review

From the reviews:

"The solution proposed by the authors of this book consists essentially of a course on the foundations of
mathematics and computer science. … As one can see … the book covers a lot of material. … One of the
good things about the book is that it covers a lot of ground in an extremely systematic way. … the book is
written with conviction, and one can see that the authors made a great effort to make it interesting to their
readers." (S. C. Coutinho, The Mathematical Gazette, Vol. 90 (517), 2006)

"This book meets the needs of a sound mathematical education of computer scientists improving formal
competence and flexibility. It very well sets forth (and proves) the essential core theory and theorist or
executive on all levels of Computer Science and IT industry will appreciate. … Having passed through all …
the student will have a broad and sufficiently deep mathematical knowledge." (H. Mitsch, Monatshefte für
Mathematik, Vol. 145 (2), 2005)

From the reviews of the second edition:

"As the title of this book suggests, it covers a broad range of topics in mathematics; it is intended for use as
an introductory textbook for computer science undergraduates. … It may be suitable for people who are
already familiar with the subject and need a reference to quickly check definitions and theorems." (I-Lun
Tseng, ACM Computing Reviews, Vol. 49 (4), April, 2008)

From the Back Cover

This two-volume textbook Comprehensive Mathematics for Computer Scientists is a self-contained
comprehensive presentation of mathematics including sets, numbers, graphs, algebra, logic, grammars,
machines, linear geometry, calculus, ODEs, and special themes such as neural networks, Fourier theory,
wavelets, numerical issues, statistics, categories, and manifolds. The concept framework is streamlined but
defining and proving virtually everything. The style implicitly follows the spirit of recent topos-oriented
theoretical computer science. Despite the theoretical soundness, the material stresses a large number of core
computer science subjects, such as, for example, a discussion of floating point arithmetic, Backus-Naur
normal forms, L-systems, Chomsky hierarchies, algorithms for data encoding, e.g., the Reed-Solomon code.
The numerous course examples are motivated by computer science and bear a generic scientific meaning.

For the second edition the entire text has been carefully reread, and many examples have been added, as well
as illustrations and explications to statements and proofs which were exposed in a too shorthand style. This
makes the book more comfortable for instructors as well as for students to handle.



Users Review

From reader reviews:

Kim Bogdan:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have more or little spare time? Yeah, you can
choose the suitable activity for spend your time. Any person spent all their spare time to take a walk,
shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open as well as read a book eligible Comprehensive
Mathematics for Computer Scientists 1: Sets and Numbers, Graphs and Algebra, Logic and Machines, Linear
Geometry (Universitext)? Maybe it is to get best activity for you. You understand beside you can spend your
time with your favorite's book, you can cleverer than before. Do you agree with it has the opinion or you
have additional opinion?

Troy Jones:

What do you regarding book? It is not important along with you? Or just adding material when you really
need something to explain what you problem? How about your free time? Or are you busy man or woman? If
you don't have spare time to perform others business, it is give you a sense of feeling bored faster. And you
have extra time? What did you do? Every individual has many questions above. They must answer that
question because just their can do which. It said that about e-book. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it
is proper. Because start from on kindergarten until university need this particular Comprehensive
Mathematics for Computer Scientists 1: Sets and Numbers, Graphs and Algebra, Logic and Machines, Linear
Geometry (Universitext) to read.

Pearl Young:

Here thing why this kind of Comprehensive Mathematics for Computer Scientists 1: Sets and Numbers,
Graphs and Algebra, Logic and Machines, Linear Geometry (Universitext) are different and trusted to be
yours. First of all reading through a book is good nevertheless it depends in the content of computer which is
the content is as tasty as food or not. Comprehensive Mathematics for Computer Scientists 1: Sets and
Numbers, Graphs and Algebra, Logic and Machines, Linear Geometry (Universitext) giving you information
deeper including different ways, you can find any e-book out there but there is no guide that similar with
Comprehensive Mathematics for Computer Scientists 1: Sets and Numbers, Graphs and Algebra, Logic and
Machines, Linear Geometry (Universitext). It gives you thrill looking at journey, its open up your personal
eyes about the thing in which happened in the world which is possibly can be happened around you. You can
actually bring everywhere like in area, café, or even in your way home by train. Should you be having
difficulties in bringing the printed book maybe the form of Comprehensive Mathematics for Computer
Scientists 1: Sets and Numbers, Graphs and Algebra, Logic and Machines, Linear Geometry (Universitext)
in e-book can be your substitute.

Jimmy Dolce:

Beside this specific Comprehensive Mathematics for Computer Scientists 1: Sets and Numbers, Graphs and
Algebra, Logic and Machines, Linear Geometry (Universitext) in your phone, it could possibly give you a



way to get closer to the new knowledge or facts. The information and the knowledge you are going to got
here is fresh from oven so don't end up being worry if you feel like an old people live in narrow commune. It
is good thing to have Comprehensive Mathematics for Computer Scientists 1: Sets and Numbers, Graphs and
Algebra, Logic and Machines, Linear Geometry (Universitext) because this book offers to you personally
readable information. Do you at times have book but you don't get what it's exactly about. Oh come on, that
won't happen if you have this in your hand. The Enjoyable blend here cannot be questionable, including
treasuring beautiful island. So do you still want to miss that? Find this book and read it from now!
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